
Whether you are a small medical practice or 

a multi-site provider, as a healthcare 

professional, you want to provide the best 

possible care for your patients. To 

administer that quality care, you and your 

staff need access to 

all critical 

information 

regarding your 

patients. A patient 

fills out paper intake 

forms, a doctor Faxes 

records on past care, 

a lab sends an 

electronic report. 

Regardless of origin, 

the patient record 

needs to reflect the 

complete picture so 

you can recommend 

a course of 

treatment.    

Improve Your System 
With Transactional 
Capture

While patient care drives the 
need for accurate, up-to-date 
and easy-to-access patient 
information, the business 
side of your practice benefits 
as well.  Your billing 
department has to properly 
code and bill for services, and 
documents must be retained 
for compliance purposes. 

Whatever the reasons, you 
want collecting that 
information to be as quick, 
and cost-effective as 
possible, keeping the focus 
on providing top-notch 
medical services while 
maintaining efficient back 
office processes to manage 
revenue cycles and fulfill 
release of information 
requests.  The One Touch 
solution enables clinics, 
outpatient surgery centers, 
medical practices and all 

other types of healthcare 
facilities to:
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Regardless of 

the size of your 

organization, 

One Touch offers 

solutions that 

seamlessly 

integrate into 

any healthcare 

application, 

database, back 

office system 

or workflow.

Create a comprehensive 
medical record with paper, fax 
and electronic data

Improve care and patient safety 
with immediate access to the 
latest medical record content

Ensure compliance by quickly 
securing all record data quickly 
and protecting access

Cut costs through eliminating 
paper, reducing storage space 
and refocusing staff time on 
more productive tasks

Speed revenue cycles through 
quicker access to coding and 
billing data

Big results with a small 
footprint requiring minimal 
space.
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With the One Touch solution, 
you can easily integrate 
scanned and faxed 
documents right into your 
EMR, EHR, ERP, ECM, 
document management 
system as you receive them. 
Your staff no longer has to 
search through paper files 
looking for documents, wait 
while someone else reviews a 
file or worry that documents 
might be missing or misfiled. 
Additionally, staff in satellite 
clinics has immediate access 
to files that can be critical if a 
patient needs to visit more 
than one office for treatment.  
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Who is One Touch Global Technologies

One Touch Global Technologies understands how to 

integrate documents into business workflows. For almost 

20 years, One Touch Global Technologies has provided 

leading-edge solutions to thousands of users processing 

millions of business-critical documents. Some of the top 

names in the healthcare, pharmaceutical, financial 

services, banking, transportation and government spaces 

rely daily on One Touch Global Technologies solutions. 

Drive top-notch 

medical services and 

efficient back office 

processes with 

accurate, up-to-date 

and easy-to-access 

patient information. 


